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English Scientific Communication
Part 9—Dealing with questions
●

Jonathan R. WOODWARD
Associate Professor, Graduate School of Arts and Sciences, The University of Tokyo

In this series of articles, we discuss a 
wide range of aspects of presenting sci-
ence in English. In the last two articles 
we have considered some ideas for what 
to do just before presenting and how to 
improve performance during a presen-
tation. Today we reach the end of the 
presentation itself and take on the chal-
lenge of answering the audience’s ques-
tions!

Just when you thought  
it was all over...

Once you reach the end of your presen-
tation, having acknowledged your co-
workers and sponsors and thanked the 
audience, it feels like it should be time 
to sit down and relax. However, for 
many people, the toughest part of the 
presentation is still to come! Young sci-
entists with not much experience of pre-
senting are usually crossing their fin-
gers at this point and hoping that no one 
will ask a question! For well-established 
scientists, they are probably feeling the 
opposite, because not having any ques-
tions might mean that nobody was inter-
ested in what they had to say! Regard-
less, in almost all cases, you will need to 
answer questions after your presenta-
tion, because the chairperson will work 
hard to ask you something, even if no-
body else does!

For a non-native English speaker, an-
swering questions at the end of a pre-
sentation poses 2 large challenges be-
yond those faced by a native speaker:

　1）Understanding the question

As well as having to have a technical un-
derstanding of the quest ion being 
asked, a perhaps even greater challenge 
is to try to understand the English of 
the person asking the question. This is 
made worse by the fact that at interna-
tional meetings, the participants come 
from all over the world and their En-
glish accents and pronunciation can 
vary enormously. In addition, many peo-
ple asking questions are too impatient 
to wait for a microphone or hold the mi-
crophone in such a way as to render it 
mostly useless, making it often difficult 
to hear them clearly.

　2） Having to answer using unpre-
pared English

For the entire presentation up to this 
point, it was possible to have complete 
control over the English language using 
many of the ideas presented in previous 
articles. Depending on how much plan-
ning and preparation the presenter is 
prepared to do, the entire presentation 
can be controlled on a word-by-word ba-
sis. As soon as the audience is able to 
ask questions, however, the presenter is 
on the spot and will have to answer with-
out backup resources. 

In real i ty, i t is possible to do more 
preparation for answering questions 
than you might imagine. For the rest of 
this month’s article, we discuss some 
ideas and tricks!

Achieving mutual 
understanding

The first challenge, then, is to correctly 

understand the question being asked. 
This is as important, if not more so, than 
proceeding to answer the question. The 
situation at international conferences 
where the presenter completely misun-
derstands the question being asked and 
therefore answers a completely dif fer-
ent question is surprisingly common. As 
a presenter, it is impor tant that you 
make every ef fort to correctly under-
stand the question. The way to achieve 
this is through confirmation and agree-
ment with the presenter. My experience 
from watching the question and answer 
process for many years is that in many 
cases, the presenter doesn’t understand 
the language, while the person asking 
the question thinks that they do not un-
derstand the science. Naturally, there 
are some cases where the language is 
not a problem and the presenter really 
doesn’t understand the question being 
asked, but I think that such cases are 
much less common.

In order to avoid this first problem, the 
presenter should work hard to be both 
honest and clear in response to the 
question. Unfortunately, most non-na-
tive speakers usually respond in this sit-
uation by saying, “I’m sorry” or some-
thing similar. If you do not understand 
the language of a question, make sure 
that you communicate this. You can say 
something like, “I’m sorry, I couldn’t 
understand your English clearly, could 
you please repeat your question?” If a 
repeat of the question doesn’t help, then 
you can then say something like, “I’m 
very sorry, I still couldn’t understand 
your question, could you rephrase it 
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please?” This may still not solve the 
problem, but if the chairperson under-
stands clearly that it is the language that 
you are struggling to understand, they 
may also be able to try and intervene 
and explain the question to you. The im-
portant point here is to be explicit, and 
therefore communicative about the rea-
sons for your misunderstanding. If the 
person ’s voice is too quiet for you to 
hear, then say so. If the question con-
tains a word that you are not familiar 
with, then say so. If you simply say, 
“once more please” or “I don’t under-
stand” then the person asking the ques-
tion doesn ’t know what to change to 
help you understand. 

The next problem arises from present-
ers who think that they have understood 
the question, but actually have not. 
Again it is quite common to observe a 
presenter confidently answer a question 
that is completely dif ferent to the one 
asked. Avoiding this problem is also a 
question of communicating effectively. 
Whenever you are asked a question and 
think you understand it, then before an-
swering the question it is a very good 
idea to confirm your understanding of 
the question with the speaker. To do so, 
you can say something like “Thank you 
for your question. If I understand you 
correctly, what you are asking is …” 
and then proceed to restate the question 
in your own words based on your what 
you have understood is being asked. 
The person asking the question can 
then either confirm that you have cor-
rectly understood or point out any areas 
of confusion.

Preparing in advance

On first thought, it seems that answer-
ing questions after presentations is a 
spontaneous process. However, this is 
not the case and a substantial amount of 
preparation can be done in advance. The 
most obvious star ting point for this 
preparation is while practicing your pre-
sentation in front of an audience. Make 
sure to get your audience to ask as 
many questions as possible after the 
presentation and make a note of them. 
That way you can prepare good answers 
both in terms of science and English 
and make a note of any particular vocab-
ulary or expressions you may need on 

the notes section of your presentation 
software. Push your colleagues / super-
visor to ask you dif ficult questions, as 
this will allow you to prepare further.

Once you have practiced in front of an 
audience and have a good idea of the 
kind of questions you may be asked, 
you can prepare additional slides to use 
during question time. As we discussed 
in previous articles, the time available 
for presentations is usually short com-
pared to the amount of information you 
wish to convey. The question time is an 
opportunity to provide more detail about 
the parts of your work that the audience 
has identified as either confusing or in-
teresting. Make sure that you have 
slides available at the end of the presen-
tation that contain any additional data, 
graphs, images etc. that may be useful 
in providing further explanation.

Turning things to your 
advantage

It is possible to take things a little bit 
fur ther by tr ying to use the question 
time to your own advantage. When poli-
ticians are interviewed on current af-
fairs programs, they are really using 
their answers to say the things that they 
want to say. Although in this context it is 
not appropriate to take things this far, it 
can be useful to view the question time 
as an opportunity to highlight aspects of 
your work that you think are particular-
ly important, draw attention to other re-
lated work you have done or discuss as-
pects that you did not have t ime to 
include in the main presentation. Having 
this objective in mind means that you 
can structure your main presentation 
with this in mind. Let us consider two 
common and useful tricks.

　1）Using suggestion

A technique used by many experienced 
presenters is to “help” the audience 
during a presentation by suggesting 
possible questions to them! A typical 
statement made might be, “I don’t have 
any time to talk about this in any more 
detail now, but you may want to ask me 
more about it during the questions.” 
There are many variants on this and it is 
surprisingly effective - most of the time, 
these “suggested” questions get asked 

at some point. In particular, it can make 
the chairperson very happy, as they will 
be trying to think of questions to ask in 
case no one in the audience asks any-
thing. 

　2）Appending your answer

Another slightly advanced technique is 
to answer the question and add some-
thing to it that you want to highlight or 
maybe forgot to mention earlier. For dif-
ficult to answer questions, accomplished 
speakers will sometimes deliberately 
answer a slightly different question than 
the one asked that better suits what 
they want to say. You can decide for 
yourself if you think that this is appro-
priate or not, but often answering the 
question in this way benefits the audi-
ence better as a whole. Very often, an-
swers of this kind are often followed by 
a statement of the kind “I’m not sure if I 
answered your question correctly, but I 
hope I did.” Next time you are at a con-
ference, keep a lookout for speakers us-
ing this technique!

Be honest

Finally, it may be sometimes be the case 
that you have understood a question 
properly, but simply do not know the an-
swer. One of the things that makes sci-
ence so important and separates scien-
tists from politicians is the ability of 
both science and scientists to say “I 
don’t know.” In fact, when you really 
don’t know the answer to a question, the 
best response is to be honest and say 
so. The person asking the question may 
have an idea, explanation or insight re-
lated to their question, which they 
might share with you. You might end up 
learning something important! It is also 
wor th remembering that sometimes 
people ask questions because they want 
to say something, not because they want 
to ask you something.

With the question time complete, your 
presentation is over and you can sit 
down, relax and take a well-ear ned 
break. Or can you? Next month we 
move on to discuss what you should do 
once the presentation is over in order to 
make sure that your next presentation 
is even better!
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